
 
FRCS SEPAC Committee Minutes 

                     

Date: 3/2/23 Time: 7-7:45pm via Zoom 

 
Members (absent): Ebony Griffin (Chair), Laurie Bryant, Jason Paynich. 

Guest: Samantha Storey, Special Needs Advocacy Network 

 

Issue Discussion Action 

1.  Meeting 
called to order 

8:00 via Zoom by Ebony Na 

1. Organizational 
Matters 

NA Na 

1. Approval of 
Minutes  

Na Na 

1. Old Business NA Na 

1. New Business: 
 

Presentation Samantha 
Storey, Pres. Of Special 
Needs Advocacy Network 

Personal webpage: 
www.lessardlearning.com 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Presented 

Lunch-n-Learn classes presented 

SEPAC has 1 free membership to 
SNAN 

SNAN can add SEPAC directory 
information 

Resource library information 

Discussed SEPAC role and 
activities, and how to make more 
effective for families 

Noted yearly Basic Rights 
Training requirement for SEPAC 
leadership 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Summer camp search links 
presented 

Discussed SEPAC advocacy role 
with FRCS 

 

Link below for Basic Rights 
required training (for SEPAC 
Board) 

https://fcsn.org/information-
center-2/ 

 

SNAN can attend school 
meetings with parents and assist 
parent in understanding the 
nuance of impending decisions. 

 

SNAN can help file a PRS 
(Problem Resolution System) 
document 

 

Areas of highest concern are 
receiving services, getting a 504 
vs. IEP, lack of transition 
program. 

 

 

Links were sent to Amanda for 
placement on the SEPAC 
webpage. 

 

1. Adjournment 
 

Meeting adjourned at 7:15pm 

Recorder:  Jason Paynich 



 
 
 


